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M.P.'S MORAL 
REARMAMENT 

STUDY 

TOUR OF EUROPE 
IN PROGRESS 

SWITZERLAND, Thursday. --
South Africa and Ole Western 
nations had to accept responsi-
bility for having created condi-
tions in which Communism 
flourished, said Mr. H. J. Klopper 
(H.N.P., Vredefort), speaking yes-
terday at Caux-Sur-Montreux, at 
the World Assembly for Moral 
Rearmament. 
Mr. Klopper, who is to tour 

Western Germany and Holland 
to study the work of Moral Re-
armament, said, "Russia came to 
the world with an ideology when 
we had nothing. She claimed the 
allegiance of millions that we 
should have had. But we were 
asleep, content with our luxuries 
and glories." 
In a world of ideologies there 

was no neutrality. One had to 
choose to fight and ,stand or fall 
by it. 
'We still have a great oppor-

tunity of offering something better 
than materialism, but if we want 
to offer it we have to get a move 
on," he said. 

MANY MISTAKES 
" In South Africa we have not 

been faultless, and have made 
many mistakes. I shall do my 
utmost to help my nation follow 
the ideology of Caux. The best 
security I can give my family and 
nation is to fight alongside those 
who aim to bring this ideology to 
mankind." 
He pledged himself to give three 

months' service to moral rearma-
ment on his return, and said he 
intended to improve the housing 
conditions of his employes. 
Mr. J. S. Labuschagne ( A.P., 

Klip River), who is touring West-
ern Germany and Holland with 
Mr. Klopper, said: "The whole 
world can take a new course on 
the basis of the moral standards 
we find here. Moral rearmament 
is the force that can show the 
way to anew day and a new way 
between nations. I am going to 
apply it to my own life with my 
family, to the people who work 
with me and to my nation."—New 
World News Service. 


