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FLAG FLIES IN INDIA 
THE FIRST Kenya flag to 

be flown over Indian' sail was 
hoisted by a South African and 
a Southern Rhodesian before re-
presentatives of 30 nations (pic- 
ture right). A one-hundred voice 
Moral Re--Armament chorus sang 
the• Kenya National Anthem. 

Watching the ceremony 
(below) were Mr. Niketu Iralu 
of Nagaland, nephew of the 
Naga leader, Mr. A. Z. Phizo, 
and Mr. Leonnard Crane of the 

Sarcee Indians in Alberta, 
Canada. 

Mr. Rajmohan, Gandhi (left), 
grandson of India's great leader, 
hailed the Independence of 
Kenya at the ceremony. 

He said: "We expect Kenya 
to be in the lead in the fight for 
the political liberation of every 
last country that remains slave 
in Africa today. We also expect 
Kenya to be in the leadin a new 
kind of revolution against the 
tyranny of materialism that is 
gripping every kind of society." 


